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Overview	
This	document	 is	a	submission	on	the	proposed	 imposition	of	 the	Goods	and	Services	Tax	
(GST)	on	Low	Value	Goods	(LVGs)	sold	to	and	imported	by	New	Zealand	buyers	(Proposed	
Measures)	 using	 electronic	 distribution	platforms	 (EDPs)	 by	 an	 industry	 group	 comprising	
Alibaba	Group’s	AliExpress,	eBay	and	Etsy,	which	are	third	party	online	marketplaces	(3P).	

Applying	the	same	tax	burden	to	remote,	often	small,	 retailers	 is	unfair	and	potentially	at	
risk	of	being	reciprocated	by	other	Governments	on	NZ	small	businesses	operating	online.		

The	current	proposal	will	 result	 in	high	 rates	of	non-compliance	and	 thus	not	achieve	 the	
desired	revenue	increases	for	the	Government	of	New	Zealand,	will	disadvantage	customers	
on	3P	platforms,	 and	will	 not	 achieve	 the	Government’s	 objective	of	 levelling	 the	playing	
field	for	New	Zealand	retailers.		

We	 also	 recommend	 the	 establishment	 of	 an	 IRD-led	 industry	 working	 group	 (including	
marketplaces,	 logistics	 providers,	 payments	 systems	 and	 retailers)	 on	 this	 matter	 and	 a	
review	of	any	model	twelve	months	after	any	 legislation	 is	passed.	Equally	NZ	should	take	
stock	of	Europe’s	timeline	on	this	matter	and	align	with	those	global	timelines.	

The	extraterritorial	 imposition	of	GST	 is	 contrary	 to	good	 tax	policy	and	has	 the	 following	
technical	complications:	

	1.	Reduced	revenue	of	$40-65	million	per	annum	–	and	rising		

The	 Government’s	 own	 estimates	 assume	 that	 two-thirds	 of	 online	 purchases	 will	 be	
captured	by	the	proposed	model.		

The	Australian	 Treasury,	when	proposing	 a	 similar	model	 in	 2017,	 assumed	 a	 compliance	
rate	 of	 just	 25%.	 Based	 on	 a	 similar	 compliance	 rate	 in	New	 Zealand,	 the	 actual	 revenue	
raised	 by	 this	 tax	 would	 be	 $40-65	 million	 per	 annum	 less	 than	 is	 projected,	 with	 the	
shortfall	rising	by	about	10%	annually	as	the	volume	of	online	trade	increases.			

The	 proposed	 model	 will	 result	 in	 significantly	 reduced	 revenue	 to	 be	 reinvested	 into	
essential	 services	 for	 New	 Zealanders	 compared	 to	 a	 model	 which	 captures	 a	 larger	
percentage	of	online	transactions.				

2.	Very	high	rates	of	non-compliance	

We	 believe	 compliance	 will	 be	 low	 as	 consumers	 will	 simply	 turn	 to	 websites	 or	
marketplaces	 that	 are	 not	 compliant;	 or	 use	 eBay	 or	 AliExpress	 as	 a	 search	 engine	 then	
purchase	 the	 equivalent	 product	 directly	 from	 the	 seller	 or	 through	 alternative,	 non-
compliant	 retailers	 who	 will	 be	 able	 to	 offer	 the	 products	 at	 15%	 less	 than	 compliant	
players;	and	which	have	spotty	track	records	regarding	consumer	protection	and	regulatory	
compliance.		

There	will	be	no	new	border	processes	 to	ensure	GST	has	been	captured.	We	understand	
that	neither	IRD	nor	Customs	will	be	given	additional	resources	to	enforce	the	new	rules.		
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3.	We	are	not	traditional	retailers			

As	 a	 technical	 matter,	 the	 proposed	 model	 is	 extremely	 difficult	 for	 3P	 marketplaces	 to	
implement	and	we	are	yet	to	analyse	any	issues	related	to	measures	taken	to	comply	with	
the	flawed	Australian	collection	model.	3P	marketplaces	do	not	hold	the	goods,	and	do	not	
control	 the	movement	 of	 the	 goods.	We	 are	 not	 the	 sellers	 or	 owners	 of	 the	 goods,	we	
simply	 connect	 buyers	 and	 sellers.	 	 The	 focus	 should	 be	 on	 1P	 retailers/suppliers	 in	 the	
truest	 sense	of	 that	word.	Government	 could	 consider	an	exemption	 for	3P	marketplaces	
and	 focus	 on	 suppliers	 in	 the	 truest	 sense	 of	 that	 word.	 In	 our	 view	 however	 a	 logistics	
services/freight	 handler	 model	 would	 be	 far	 more	 effective	 and	 capture	 all	 LVG	 parcels	
coming	across	the	border,	as	we	outlined	during	Australian	consultations	too.		

4.	Unprecedented	compliance	costs	will	increase	costs	for	Kiwi	consumers	

The	proposed	model	will	 require	extensive	 system	changes	and	ongoing	compliance	costs	
that	will	 at	 least	 be	 partly	 borne	 by	 consumers	 as	 the	NZ	GST	 is	 a	 consumption	 tax,	 and	
therefore	 a	 tax	 on	 consumers.	What	 Government	 is	 proposing	 is	 that	 suppliers	 bear	 the	
brunt	of	 collection.	 eBay,	 Etsy	 and	AliExpress	 are	 global	 platforms.	 These	 system	changes	
are	technically	difficult	and	will	still	result	in	a	less-than-optimal	rate	of	revenue	collection.		
There	is	a	high	degree	of	risk	that	consumers	and	businesses	will	face	complications	with	the	
implementation	of	the	proposed	model	as	it	is	novel,	complex	and	remains	untested.		

5.	New	Zealand	retailers	remain	disadvantaged			

To	use	Australian	Treasury	modelling	as	an	example,	New	Zealand	businesses	will	continue	
to	 be	 disadvantaged	 as	 up	 to	 75%	 of	 low	 value	 goods	 imported	 into	 New	 Zealand	 will	
continue	not	to	be	taxed,	and	thus	continue	to	have	a	tax-price	advantage	over	goods	sold	
locally	 in	New	Zealand.	 	This	rate	could	 increase	should	overseas	retailers	or	marketplaces	
decide	not	to	offer	products	to	New	Zealand	consumers.	This	has	been	the	case	in	Australia	
where	Amazon	has	decided	 to	 restrict	 cross-border	 sales.	 	Changing	 the	GST	 laws	as	 they	
relate	to	overseas	online	purchases	will	not	fix	all	the	issues	faced	by	traditional	retailers:	for	
example,	but	not	limited	to	wages,	cost	of	rent	and	general	cost	of	doing	business	in	NZ.	

6.	Unfair	to	SMBs	and	individual	sellers	

Under	current	GST	rules,	vendors	who	sell	less	than	$60,000	of	goods	into	New	Zealand	are	
exempt	 from	GST.	Under	 the	 new	proposal,	 overseas	 Small	 and	Micro	 Businesses	 (SMBs)	
will	no	 longer	be	exempt	 if	 they	sell	 through	a	platform	 like	eBay,	Etsy	or	AliExpress.	This	
puts	 small	 businesses	 at	 a	 severe,	 clear	 and	 discriminatory	 disadvantage	 if	 they	 use	 3P	
marketplaces,	compared	to	suppliers	who	sell	directly	 through	websites	or	other	channels	
which	 may	 result	 in	 decreased	 visibility,	 transparency	 and	 compliance	 in	 respect	 of	
regulations	set	by	New	Zealand	authorities.	

7.	Higher	trade	barriers		

The	 extraterritorial	 application	 of	New	 Zealand’s	GST	 laws	will	 create	 additional	 costs	 for	
overseas	businesses	and	 limit	 the	free	trade	of	goods	 into	New	Zealand.	This	 is	not	 in	the	
spirit	of	various	free	trade	agreements	across	the	globe.	
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The	 proliferation	 of	 efforts	 to	 expand	 the	 imposition	 of	 local	 sales-type	 taxes	 on	 remote	
small	 businesses	 in	 the	 name	 of	 fairness	 will	 make	 it	 harder	 for	 Internet-enabled	 small	
enterprises	to	export.			

Before	the	Internet	very	small	enterprises	and	microentrepreneurs	rarely,	if	ever	exported.		
They	 were	 generally	 trapped	 in	 their	 local	 market,	 increasingly	 faced	 direct	 competition	
from	large	enterprises	with	greater	access	to	global	markets,	and	were	subject	to	ups	and	
downs	 of	 their	 economic	 neighbourhood.	 	 The	 Internet	 has	 dramatically	 expanded	 the	
opportunity	to	small	businesses	to	trade.	 	While	 it	 is	still	very	difficult	 for	small	and	micro	
enterprises	 to	 compete	 head-on	 with	 giant	 competitors,	 access	 to	 global	 commerce	
platforms	 with	 many	 millions	 of	 users	 has	 allowed	 small	 enterprises,	 including	 in	 New	
Zealand,	to	carve	out	successful	niches	and	grow.		A	better	future	for	small	businesses,	who	
will	continue	to	face	large	competitors	with	their	traditional	access	to	global	markets,	is	to	
maintain	 low	 tax	 barriers	 and	 promote	 access	 to	 greater	 Internet-enabled	 exports	 and	
imports.			

A	fairer	more	efficient	collection	model	
The	 authors	 of	 this	 submission	 believe	 the	 proposed	 model	 should	 be	 abandoned	 and	
replaced	 with	 a	 fairer	 more	 effective	 model,	 for	 example	 one	 based	 on	 an	 extension	 of	
current	systems	such	as	via	collection	at	the	border.	This	is	what	already	happens	for	goods	
worth	more	than	$400.	Under	the	current	proposal,	there	would	be	one	system	for	goods	
under	$400,	and	another	system	for	everything	else.		

A	 border	 collection	model	would	 address	many	 of	 the	 concerns	 raised	 above,	 and	would	
significantly	 increase	 the	 revenue	 captured.	 100%	 of	 imports	 pass	 through	 the	 border	 so	
100%	of	GST	would	be	collected.		

Alternatively,	 the	 current	 proposals	 require	 rewriting	 to	 ensure	 they	 are	 workable.	 In	
particular,	 3P	 marketplaces	 that	 merely	 provide	 listing	 and	 processing	 services	 to	 users	
should	be	treated	differently	under	the	proposed	amendments.	3P	marketplaces	do	not	set	
the	 price,	 hold	 or	 handle	 goods,	 or	 have	 full	 knowledge	 of	 the	 flow	 of	 physical	 goods	 –	
therefore	a	model	intended	for	online	retailers	cannot	be	easily	applied	to	our	platforms.				

We	 would	 welcome	 the	 opportunity	 for	 further	 discussion	 of	 the	 points	 made	 in	 this	
submission.		

About	Us		
The	members	of	the	Industry	Group	operate	websites	that	provide	the	ability	for	sellers	to	
list	goods	for	sale	to	buyers.	These	services	are	referred	to	as	“3P”.	3P	service	providers	rely	
on	 the	 information	 provided	 from	 users,	 do	 not	 set	 the	 price	 of	 the	 goods,	 and	 do	 not	
handle	the	goods.	It	is	important	to	distinguish	“3P”	services	from	“1P”	services	where	the	
website	operator	acquires	the	goods	wholesale	and	resells	the	goods	in	its	own	right.		

Further	information	on	each	member	of	the	Industry	Group	is	outlined	below.	
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Alibaba	Group’s	mission	is	to	make	it	easy	to	do	business	anywhere.	The	company	aims	to	
build	the	future	infrastructure	of	commerce.	It	envisions	that	its	customers	will	meet,	work	
and	live	at	Alibaba,	and	that	it	will	be	a	company	that	lasts	at	least	102	years.		

	

eBay	Inc.	(NASDAQ:	EBAY)	is	a	global	commerce	leader	including	the	Marketplace,	StubHub	
and	Classifieds	platforms.	Collectively,	eBay	connects	millions	of	buyers	and	sellers	around	
the	 world,	 empowering	 people	 and	 creating	 opportunity	 through	 Connected	 Commerce.	
Founded	 in	 1995	 in	 San	 Jose,	 Calif.,	 eBay	 is	 one	 of	 the	 world’s	 largest	 and	most	 vibrant	
marketplaces	for	discovering	great	value	and	unique	selection.	As	at	Q1,	2018	eBay	had	171	
million	 active	 users	 globally.	 For	 more	 information	 about	 the	 company	 and	 its	 global	
portfolio	of	online	brands,	visit	www.ebayinc.com		

	

Etsy,	Inc.	is	the	global	marketplace	for	unique	and	creative	goods.	Our	mission	is	to	keep	
commerce	human,	and	we're	committed	to	using	the	power	of	business	to	strengthen	
communities	and	empower	people.	We	connect	millions	of	buyers	and	sellers	from	nearly	
every	country	in	the	world.	Buyers	come	to	Etsy	to	be	inspired	and	delighted	by	items	that	
are	crafted	and	curated	by	creative	entrepreneurs.	For	sellers,	we	offer	a	range	of	tools	and	
services	that	address	key	business	needs.	A	typical	Etsy	seller	is	a	female	entrepreneur	
working	out	of	her	home	to	supplement	her	household’s	income.	In	2017	Etsy	had	1.9	
million	such	microentrepreneurs.	 
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